Zimbra

A
f.avila@maﬁ.mil.br

RE: Request for quotation reference Q2024-0083 (Q2024-aoes.23*’§smks) AT B A g/

/

De : Daniel Korbage <daniel_korbage@keysight.com>
Assunto : RE: Request for quotation reference Q2024-0083 (Q2024-0083.23-1LQK8)
Para : dabm somar cnbw <dabm.somar.cnbw@marinha.mil.br>

qua., 11 de set. de 2024 17:13

Miuiito boa tards,

Obrigado pelo contata, os itens contidos na RFQ: Q2024-0083 na séo de fabricagho ou comercializacao da Keysight.

Frora: Gabirn 3 p
Sent: Wednesday, September 11, 20
To: a
Subject: Reguest for

Y
24 12:46 PM
] Keysightorders
gquotation reference Q2024-0083 {Q2024-0083.23-1LGKE)

This Message is From an External Sender: Use caution opening files, clicking links or responding to requests.

Dear Sir or Madam,

Please find attached our Request for Quote. For your convenience, you might send us your guote by fitling our request
for quotation form, the spreadsheet file or on your own quotation form.

Please note that our Request for Quotation Form and the spreadsheet file are altached to this email,

Ta submit your response and/ior if you have any questions, please contact us via e-mail at o

Looking forward tc your reply.

Best Regards.

BRAZILIAN NAVAL COMMISSION
5130 MacArthur BLVD., N.W.
Washington, D.C. 20016-3344
Telephone: (202) 244-3950

Fax: (202) 237-6714







‘Zimbra f.avila@marinha.mil.br

L

FW: Request for quotation reference Q2024-0083 (Q2024~0(}83,4G§§1>826;}

De : Ryan Couture <ryan.couture@habco biz> qui..

Assunto ; FW, Request for quotation reference Q2024-0083 (02024-0083.46-51826)
Para : cnbw rfg <cnbw rfg@marinha.mil.br>

wWe do not recognize these PNs.

This is a "No bid"

Ryan Couture

Sales — Account Executive

Ryan.Couture@Habco.biz www habro biz

Office: (860) 430-5133

172 0ak St. Glastonbury, (T 06033

4/10 Schedule -~ Qut of Office Every Friday
Effective Week of July 1st through September 30th

Follow us:

Warning, information subject to export control laws. The information contained within this
email may be subject to the International Traffic in Arms Regulation (ITAR} or the Export
Administration Regulations (EAR). This information shall not be exported, released, or
disclosed to foreign naticnals inside or outside the United States without first complying
with the export authorization requirements of the ITAR and/or the EAR.

: please consider the environment before printing this e-mail

THIS MESSAGE IS INTENDED ONLY FOR THE USE OF THE INDIVIDUAL OR ENTITY TO WHICH IT IS5
ADDRESSED AND MAY CONTAIN INFORMATION THAT IS PRIVILEGED, CONFIDENTIAL, AND EXEMPT FROM
DISCLOSURE UNDER APPLICABLE LAW, If the reader of this message is not the intended
recipient, or the employee or agent responsible for delivering the message to the intended
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, distribution, forwarding, or
copying of this communication is strictly prohibited. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify the sender immediately by e-mail or telephone, and
delete the original message immediately.

~~~~~~ Original Message-----

From: dabm.somar.cnbw@marinha. mil.br <dabm.somar.cnbw@marinha.mil.br>

Sent: Wednesday, September 11, 2024 2:28 PM

To: Ryan Couture <ryan.couture@habco.biz>; Ryan Couture <ryan.couture@nabco.biz>
Subject: Request for quotation reference (2024-0083 (Q2824-0083.46-51826)

Dear Sir or Madam,
Please find attached our Reguest for Quote. For your convenience, you might send us your
guote by filling our request for quotation form, the spreadsheet file or on your own

guotation form,

Please note that our Request for Quotation Form and the spreadsheet file are attached to
this email.

To submit your response and/or if you have any questions, please contact us via e-mail at
cnbw. rfa@marinha.mil.br.

Looking Torward to your reply.

Best Regards,



BRAZILIAN NAVAL COMMISSION
5130, MacArthur BLVD., N.W.
Washington= i . 20016-3344

£
Telephone:I1¥02) 244-3950 |
Fax: (202) {R37-6714
Email: cnby Yfo@marinha.mil.br
WARNING: Thi9 email ofiginated outside of HABCO. DO NOT CLICK links or altachments unless
you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.
e (2024-0083.46-51826 pdf
27 KB
e (22024-0083.46-51826.xs
- 15KB
¢
{
\\*e



Zimbra f.avila@marinha.milfﬁf' :

-

RE: [EXTERNAL] Request for quotation reference Q2024-0083 {onz4~coss.ss@ RGIL)

Yy
[ACNR R

De : Adriana Diaz <adriana diaz@alfalaval com> qui, 12 de sel. de 2024 09:42

Assunto : RE: [EXTERNAL] Reguest for quotation reference Q2024-0083
(Q2024-0083 58-71871)

Para : dabm somar cnbw <dabm.somar cnbw@marinha.mil br>
Good morning,

S 3anexcs .

Thanks fﬁf your request. We do not catalogue with NSN p/n's. Please resubmit your
request with Alfa Laval part numbers

Also, please advise who is the end user and end destination. We will alsc need a
completed copy of the attached export compliance letter

Effe;tive September 1st, Alfa Laval will no longer pay the surcharge fees imposed by
credit card companies for processing payments. If you choose to pay by credit card, you

will be responsible for paying the surcharge/transaction fee, typically 2-3% of the total
amount.

Best Regards,
Adriana Diaz

Adriana Diaz

Logistics Parts Coordinator

Tel direct: +1-215-443-4091 Tel switchboard: +1-215-443-4000 - Fax: +1-215-443-4100
adriana.diaz@alfalaval.com

Contact me on MS Lync/Communicator: sip:adriana.diazealfalaval.com

Alfa Laval Inc.

865 Easton Road, Suite 300 - Warrington, PA 18976 - United States

Tel switchboard: +1 215-443-4080 - Fax switchboard: +1 215-443-4234

www alfalaval.ug - customerservice.usagalfalaval.com

This e-mail is intended solely for the use of the individual or entity to whom it is
addressed and its

content shall be regarded as confidential unless explicitly stated ostherwise. If you have
received this e-mail

by mistake, please notify the sender immediately by e-mail and delete this e-mail from
your system.

Personal date and email will be handled in accordance with the Alfa Laval Privacy Policy.

Classified by Alfa Laval as: Business

From: dabm.somar.cnbw@narinha.mil. br <dabm.somar. cnbw@marinha.mil.or>

Sent: Wednesday, Sepltember 11, 2024 2:17:38 PM (UTC-05:00) Eastern Time (US & Canada)
To: Issaiah Sistrunk; Customerservice USA; Sandra Cocates

subject: [EXTERNAL] Request for quotation reference (2024-0083 (Q2024-H083.58-71871)

CAUTION. This e-mail originated from outside of Alfa Laval. Please be mindful of
attachments and links,

Dear Sir ar Madam,

Please find attached our Request for Quote. For your convenience, you might send us your
guote by filling our request for quotation form, the spreadsheet file or on your own
guatation form.

Please note that our Reguest for Quotation Form and the spreadsheet file are attached to



this eﬁéilq

CTo submitytigr response and/or if you have any guestions, please contact us via e-mail at
cnbw. rfg@narinha.mil. br.
i s

iLookpy Torward o your reply.
Bestigzggfﬁé.

BRAZTLTIAN NAVAL COMMISSION
5138 MacArthur BLVD., N.W.
Washington, D.C. 20016-3344
Telephone: {202) 244-3950
Fax: (202) 237-6714
Email: cnbw.rfa@marinha.mil.br
e (Q2024-0083.58-71871.pdf

27 KB

- Q2024-0083.58-71871.xls
15 KB

== Export Compliance Letter March 2024.pdf
228 KB



/

Zimbra

f.avila@marinha.mil.br

Pt

RE: [External] - Request for quotation reference Q2024-0083 (Q2024-0083.5§-7J998), ef 103527 431y %égx}

De : Zoe Grubbs <Zoe.Grubbs@kratosdefense.com> ter.. 17 de sét. d 2024 1’0:(}4

Assunto : RE: [External] - Request for quotation reference Q2024-0083
(Q2024-0083.55-7J998), raf 103527

Para : dabm somar cnbw <dabm.somar.cnbw@marinha.mil.br>

Cc : Fabiana <f.avila@marinha.mil.br>. Steven Baker
<Steven.Baker@kratosdefense.com>

Hello,

We're not going to bid on these parts.

Thank you

Zoe Gruhbs

Contracts Administrator

Kratos Unmanned Aerial Systems

Cell: 916-384-8329

FX: 916-992-5335 .

--Please update Email address--: zoe.grubbs@KratosDefense.com

WARNING - Kratos Unmanned Aerial Systems Proprietary and Competition Sensitive Data. This
message may contain privileged, proprietary and/or competition sensitive information.

This email and any attachments may contain confidential and proprietary information and
must be treated as such. In addition, export or re-export of the information contained in
or attached to this email may be prohibited under export control laws.

This communication may also contain dsta subject to U.S. export laws, not releasable to
Foreign Persons unless authorized by 22 CFR 120-138 or 15.CFR 730-774. If so, that data
subject to the International Traffic in Arms Regulation cannot be disseminated,
distributed or copied to foreign nationals, residing in the U.S. or abroad, absent the
express prior approval of the U.S. Department of State. If you have received this
communication in error, please notify the sender by reply e-mail and destroy the e-mail
message and any physical coples made of the communication. Thank you.

————— Original Message-----

From: dabm.somar.cnbw@marinha.mil.br <dabm.somar.cnbw@marinha,.mil. br>

Sent: Wednesday, September 11, 2824 11:18 AM

To: Zoe Gruhbs <Zoe.Grubbs@kratosdefense.com>,; Zoe Grubbs <70e.Grubbs@kratosdefense. com>
Subject: [Externall - Request for guotation reference Q2024-0083 (Q2024-0083.55-71998)

CAUTION: This email originated from outside of the organization. Do not click links or
open attachments unless you recognize the sender and know the content is safe.

Dear Sir or Madam,

Please find attached our Reguest for Quote. For your convenience, you might send us your
quote by filling our request for guotation form, the spreadsheet file or on your own

guotation form.

Please note that our Request for Quotation Form and the spreadsheet file are attached to
this email.



To submit your response and/or if you have any questions, please contact us via e-mail at
cnbw rf~@gmarinha.mil.br.

Lookinﬁ%#ggaarélto your reply.
'ysgst Rigards,

BRAZILIAN NAVAL COMMISSICN
5130 MacArthur BLVD,., N.W.
Washington, D.C. 20016-3344
Telephone: [202) 244-3950

Fax: (282) 237-6714

Emzil: cnbw.rfg@marinha.mil.br




g“f?%“’f{‘s’% )
CAGE S - NO BID

f.avila@marinha.mil.br

Zimbra

FW: [EXTERNAL] Request for Quotation reference Q2024-0083

I S £

De : JacksonMSCOrder-Quctes <JacksonMSOrder-Quotes@Eaton.com=
Assunto : FW [EXTERNAL] Request for Quotation reference Q2024-0083
Para : cnbw rfq <cnbw.rfiq@marinha mil.br>
Cc : favila <f.avila@marinha.mil.br>

qui., 12 de set. de 2024 08[14

4% 2 anexos

Dear Customer,
Thank you for your RFQ

Unfortunately, at this time Eaton is unable to provide 2 price for a part number#

081-001456-003
400-819510RC0O
570-000000-009
102-000906-0C0
€07-060025R00
300-204300R0C
021-100011R00

that does not axist in our system,
We consider this request for quotation closed far above parts.

Should you cbtain additional information for the correct part number, plesse re-submit a new RFQ for Eston’s
consideration with an alternate PN

Thanks, and Eaton appreciates your business.

Thanks, and Regards,
Quote Entry Team

From: cnbw.rfg@marinha.mil.br <gcnow rfg@marinha.mil.br>

Sent: Thursday, September 12, 2024 2,08 AM

To: CNBW.RFQ <cnbw.rdg@marinha.mi br>

Ce: Fabiana <f.avila@marinha.mil.br>

Subject: [EXTERNAL] Request for Quotation reference Q2024-0083

Dear Sir or Madam,

Please find attached our Reguest for Quote.

For your convenience, you might send us your quote by filling our request for quotation form or on your own
quotation form. ‘

Please note that our Reguest for Quotation Form is attached to this email and due date is September 23rd
2024

To submit your response and/or if you have any questions, please contact us via e-mall at

cabve fdg@@marinha milbr, o
Please estimated your shipping/handling fees considering delivery to our Freignt Forwarder in Virginia.
Make sure lo include all costs.

Looking forward to your reply.
Best Regards.

BRAZILIAN NAVAL COMMISSION
5130 MacArthur BLVD., NJW.
Washington, D.C. 20018-3344



Telephone: (202) 244-3950
Fax: (202) 237-6714 ‘

Email: erbw fa@marinne mib by

B

- Q2024-0083-1.
37 KB

w (12024-0083.xIs
© 14 KB
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f.avila@marinha.mil.br
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Zimbra
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De : smclarty@macaerospace.com qua., 18 da sel. dé2824z/2118
Assunto : Your Ref: 02024-0083, MAC Ref: R2400M-492, Quote 1D: 267363 ‘

Para : cnbw rfg <enbw.rfg@marinha.mil.br>
Hellao,

Your Ref: Q2024-0083, MAC Ref: R2409M-492, Quote ID: 267363 : ‘;L:}

21 anexo

Enclosed please.find our "No Bid" response to your referenced Request for Quotation.
Should you require any additional information, please feel free to contact us,

Kindest regards,

Stephanie McLarty

Tel: 783-885-8066

Fax: 703-885-8067
smclarty@nacaerospace. Com
MAC Aerospace Corp.

DISCLAIMER: This e-mail message and any attachments are intended solely for the use of the
individual or entity to which it is addressed and may contain information that is
confidential or legally privileged. If you are not the intended recipient, you are hereby
notified that any dissemination, distribution, copying or other use of this message or its
attachments is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please
notify the sender immediately and permanently deiete this message and any attachments.

e QUOte-267363.pdf

15 KB
De : smclarly@macaerospace com qua., 18 de set. de 2024 12:18
Assunto : Your Ref: Q2024-0083, MAC Ref: R2409M-492, Quote ID. 267363 51 anaxo
Para : cnbw riq <cnbwrfg@marinha. mil.br>
Hello,

Enclosed please find our “No Bid" response to your referenced Request for Quotatioen.
Should you require any additional information, please feel free to contact us.

Kindest regards,

Stephanie Mclarty

Tel: 703-885-8066

Fax: 703-885-8067
smelarty@macaerospace. com
MAC Aerospace Corp.

DISCLAIMER: This e-mail message and any attachments are intended solely for the'use of the
individual or entity to which it is addressed and may contain information that is

confidential or legally privileged. If you are notl the intended recipieai: you are here?y
notified that any dissemination, distribution, copying or other use of this message or its
attachments is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please
notify the sender immediately and permanently delete this message and any attachments.



e QUOtE-267363.pdf
15 KB




MAC AEROSPACE CORPORAWION
14558 LEE ROAD * CHANTILLY, YA 2015/-1632
Main Tel {703) 502-8300 * FAX: {703) 502-86303
CAGE: 6LGT4

TO: BRAZILIAN NAVAL COMMISSION YOUR REF.:
. Q20240083
5130 MACARTHUR BLVD., N.W. QUOTE NO.: R2409M-492
WASEINGTION, DC 20016 DATE: 2024-05-18
ATTN: QUOTES PHONE: 202-244-3850
FAX: 202-237-6714

WE ARE PLEASED TO SUBMIT OUR QUOTATION FOR THE FOLLOWING ITEM(S) IN RESPONSE TO YOUR SUBJECT INQUIRY

ITEM| QUANTITY | UNIT | PART NUMBER/NSN/DESCRIPTION /PRICE AMOUNT CND” EST DEL
1 0| Ba |081-001456-002 NO QUOTE NO QUOTE
5985-01~629-7098
ANTENHA
KO QUOTE
2 0| BAa |400-819510R00 HO QUOTE NHO QUOTE

5841-01-586~9034
TRANSPONDER, RADAR
HC QUOTE

3 0| EA |570-000000-009 NO QUOTE NC QUOTE
1560-01~-630-2244

WING ASSEMBLY, AIRCRAFT
NO QUOTE

4 Q EA |002-000906-000 NG QUOTE NO QUOTE
16B0~01-661-6454

CYLINDER ASSEMBLY, REACTION
NO QUOTE

5 G} EA 007-060025R00 NHC QUOTE NO QUOTE
2945-01-593~1716
FILTER, FLUID

NO QUOTE

& o EA | 300-204300R00 NC QUOTE NO QUOTE
6140-01~595~2438
BATTERY, STORAGE
NO QUOTE

7 0 EA 021-100011R00 NO QUOTE NO QUCTE
2945-01-593=-1701
FILTER ELEMENT, FLUID

NO QUOTE
QUOTATION TOTAL: $0.00
TERMS:NET 3C DAYS VALIDITY: 45 DAYS FOB: CHANTILLY, VA
Lina/Order Minimm $250 USD. Svbjact Lo Terms and Conditions (MAC 004) Rev.
10/16. Payment terms are wilh approved credit. Jtems controlled for export - {
under "ITAR" aubject to $250 USD Iee per l1icense and/cr amendment. Purchase \ )
Ordexs must indicate and-user and specific appiication of itsms undsr o 4 w{r“’j
contract, If US Govarnmenkt Inspection (G8X) is xequired, it must be cleavly -

noted on R¥Qs and Purchase Oxdess. Rdditional foos per occurrence may e Stephanie Ec:‘f.a,t‘{ty
requized at a rats up To $50C USD unleas otherwise indicated.

PAGE: 10OF 1
QF05-3, REV?
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f.avila@marinha.mil.br
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Zimbra

RE: Request for Quotation reference Q2024-0083

De : Erik Coates <ecoates@proservaviation.com> qua., 11 de set. de 2024 1641
Assunto : RE: Request for Quotation reference Q2024-0083 453 anéxos
Para ; cnbw rfg <cnbw.rig@marinha.mil.br>
Cc : Fabiana <f.avila@marirha. mil.br>

Hella!

Thank yau for your inquiry. Unfortunately, we do not have stock available for this item, and we are unable o scurce it at
this time. Please do not hesitate to reach oul to us with any future requests you may have We're here to assist you.

FREE SHIPPING 2
10% OFF

CHECK CUT VYPER PRODUCTS  §
ON OUR WEBSITE

ﬁ?}aasmrdmzm
Erik Coates

10851 Soulh Qakview Parkway, Suite 400
Cak Creek, Wisconsin 53154
infwww ProservAviation.com

Prowd Partoer of

=

From: cnbw,riq@ marinha.milbr <cnbw.rfq@marinha.milbr>
Sent: Wednesday, September 11, 2024 3:38 PM

To: CNBW RFQ <cnbw.rfg@marinha.milbrs

Co: fabiana <favila@matinha.mil.br>

Subject: Request for Guotation reference Q20240083

Dear Sir or Madam,

Pleass find attached our Request for Quote.

For your convenience, you might send us your guote by filling our request for quotation form or an your own
guotation form.

Please note that our Request for Quotation Form is attached to this email and due date is September 23rd
2024

To submit your response andfor if you have any questions, please contact us via e-mail at
cnbw rig@marnrnha. mi. b,




Please estimated your shipping/handling fees considering delivery to our Freight Forwarder in Virginia.
Make sure to include all costs.

Looking forward téﬁyour reply.
Best ards,

BRAZILIAN NAVAL COMMISSION
5130 MacArthur BLVD.. NW.
Washington, D.C. 20016-3344
Telephone; (202) 244-3950

Fax: {202) 237-8714

Email: cnbw risi@mannha.milbr




Bom dia cmte! O CC Caixeta DBQ do QE-1 e esta de transito. o
Quer que eu altere a SE PE91100-2024-00283 de 02 UN para 06 UN? ]

R: Afirmativo. ﬁﬂ

Outro ponto é a questdo do Program Support no valor de aprox. USD 1600,00. Consegui Colo‘\car‘comow ’
custo indireto da ordem de compra, entendi que esse valor é indissocidvel da aquisicao.

Comentarios: Afirmartivo cmte. Acabou que néo teremos saida. E aceitar mesmo.
Ficamos no AGU da MSG.
Desde ja, agradeco a ajuda de sempre.

Respeitosamente,

MILLOR de Borborema Espirito Santo
Capitdo de Corveta / Lieutenant Commander (LCDR)
Enc. Subsecdo de Helicopteros SH-16 / S-70B Logistics Manager
T.: +55 22 2621-4019 / Retelma: 8117-4019
Email: millor@marinha.mil.br

De: "Victor" <leonardo.victor@marinha.mil.br>

Para: "Leonardo Caixeta" <leonardo.caixeta@marinha.mil.br>

Cc: "Estrella” <estrella@marinha.mil.br>, "daniel chaves" <daniel.chaves@marinha.mil.br>,
"Cardinot" <cardinot@marinha.mil.br>, "Millor" <09005005@marinha.mil.br>, "eduardo medeiros”
<eduardo.medeiros@marinha.mil.br>, "Patricia Basso” <patricia.basso@marinha.mil.br>, "Hedy
Kuperman" <hedy.kuperman@marinha.mil.br>

Enviadas: Segunda-feira, 7 de julho de 2025 17:57:29

Assunto: Re: Batteries aquisition (Brazil)

Isso mesmo!

Geramos a ordem de compra, considerando os 5 itens do seu e -mail.

Perceba que o item da SE PE91100-2024-00283 foram cotados 6 itens no orcamento enquanto na SE
foram solicitados apenas 02.

Quer que eu altere a SE PE91100-2024-00283 de 02 UN para 06 UN?

Outro ponto é a questdo do Program Support no valor de aprox. USD 1600,00. Consegui colocar como
custo indireto da ordem de compra, entendi que esse valor é indissocidvel da aquisicdo.



?Q/

Assim que tiver uma posicdo sua, mandarei msg para a OM SOL IND de recursos e SOL RAT os
termos e condi¢des da empresa.
Té&o logq, recebermos os recursos, assinaremos a ordem de compra e encaminharemos a empresa.

E possivel que nossa OC tenha que se submeter aos termos e condicdes da empresa. Por isso é
importante uma andlise técnica dos termos e condi¢Ges que o Sr. James Morgan encaminhou junto ao
orgamento.

Att/Rsptm,
CF (IM) Victor

De: "Leonardo Caixeta" <leonardo.caixeta@marinha.mil.br>

Para: "Victor" <leonardo.victor@marinha.mil.br>

Cc: "estrella" <estrella@marinha.mil.br>, "daniel chaves" <daniel.chaves@marinha.mil.br>,
"Cardinot" <cardinot@marinha.mil.br>, "Millor" <09005005@marinha.mil.br>, "eduardo medeiros"
<eduardo.medeiros@marinha.mil.br>, "Patricia Basso" <patricia.basso@marinha.mil.br>
Enviadas: Quarta-feira, 2 de julho de 2025 8:11:46

Assunto: Re: Batteries aquisition (Brazil)

Prezado CF(IM) Vitor,

Acho que precisa dos itens associados as SE-PE, correto? Eu ndo tenho acesso as SE-PE no sistema,
mas tenho os nimeros associados aos itens. Seria somente associar os PN as SE.

Item do -

Orcamento PN Descrigdo Qnt SE-PE
400- SE-PE 91100-

1 819510R00 ANTENNA TRANSPONDER, MODE C 6 2024-00283
002-000906- SE-PE 91100-

2 000 BUNGEE, CAPTURE, 16.5-17.0 FT 4 2024-00285
007- . . . SE-PE 91100-

3 060025R00 Filter, Oil, Hydraulic 2 2024-00286
4 300- BATTERY ASSEMBLY - AIRCRAFT, 19 SE-PE 91100-

204300R00 19.2V, 1500mAh 2024-00287
5 021- FILTER-SEPARATOR, LIQUID FUEL - 15 9 SE-PE 91100-

100011R00 GPH, 2 MICRON 2024-00288

Qualquer outra informacéo estou a disposicao.

Respeitosamente,



CC(EN) Leonardo Caixeta

De: "Victor" <leonardo.victor@marinha.mil.br>

Para: "Leonardo Caixeta" <leonardo.caixeta@marinha.mil.br>

Cc: "estrella" <estrella@marinha.mil.br>, "daniel chaves" <daniel.chaves@marinha.mil.br>,
"Cardinot" <cardinot@marinha.mil.br>, "Millor" <09005005@marinha.mil.br>, "eduardo medeiros"
<eduardo.medeiros@marinha.mil.br>, "Patricia Basso" <patricia.basso@marinha.mil.br>
Enviadas: Terca-feira, 1 de julho de 2025 10:18:26

Assunto: Re: Batteries aquisition (Brazil)

Acho que vocé ndo entendeu a pergunta
Att/Rsptm,

CF (IM) Victor

De: "Leonardo Caixeta" <leonardo.caixeta@marinha.mil.br>

Para: "Victor" <leonardo.victor@marinha.mil.br>

Cc: "estrella" <estrella@marinha.mil.br>, "daniel chaves" <daniel.chaves@marinha.mil.br>,
"Cardinot" <cardinot@marinha.mil.br>, "Millor" <09005005@marinha.mil.br>, "eduardo medeiros"
<eduardo.medeiros@marinha.mil.br>, "Patricia Basso" <patricia.basso@marinha.mil.br>
Enviadas: Terca-feira, 1 de julho de 2025 8:11:39

Assunto: Re: Batteries aquisition (Brazil)

Prezado CF(IM) Vitor,

Estou ENC anexo a planilha contendo os precos fornecidos para o contrato que esta em negociagdo. Eu
consegui localizar os itens, porém estdo todos ligeiramente mais caros do que em relacdo ao planejado
com o contrato.

Outro ponto importante é essa cobranca de suporte, ndo ha como quantifica-la.

Contudo, como ndo temos contrato no momento, ndo consigo vislumbrar uma obrigacdo da empresa
em manter o preco visto ser uma compra direta, ndo sei e temos como questionar esse fato. Nos restaria

aceitar ou nao.

Ressalto que sdo itens extremamente criticos ao Esquadrdo hoje e que temos a IND de recursos para
concluir a compra.

Respeitosamente,



CC(EN) Leonardo Caixeta

o

De: "V?cgtir" <leonardo.victor@marinha.mil.br>

Para: "Leonardo Caixeta" <leonardo.caixeta@marinha.mil.br>

Cc: "estrella" <estrella@marinha.mil.br>, "daniel chaves" <daniel.chaves@marinha.mil.br>,
"Cardinot" <cardinot@marinha.mil.br>, "Millor" <09005005@marinha.mil.br>, "eduardo medeiros"
<eduardo.medeiros@marinha.mil.br>, "Patricia Basso" <patricia.basso@marinha.mil.br>
Enviadas: Segunda-feira, 30 de junho de 2025 16:22:16

Assunto: Re: Batteries aquisition (Brazil)

Prezado CC Leonardo Caixeta, boa tarde.
Nosso setor de aquisicdo ndo conseguiu uma exata correspondéncia dos itens do or¢camento com as
SSEE.

Poderia revisar o or¢camento da empresa especificando quantos itens de cada SSEE devem ser
adquiridos?

Respeitosamente / Atenciosamente,

CF (IM) Victor

Encarregado da Divisdo de Procura e Aquisicao
Encarregado da Divisdo de Trafego de Cargas
CNBW

RETELMA: 8151-1310

- leonardo.victor@marinha.mil.br

De: "Victor" <leonardo.victor@marinha.mil.br>

Para: "Leonardo Caixeta" <leonardo.caixeta@marinha.mil.br>

Cc: "estrella" <estrella@marinha.mil.br>, "daniel chaves" <daniel.chaves@marinha.mil.br>,
"Cardinot" <cardinot@marinha.mil.br>, "Millor" <09005005@marinha.mil.br>, "eduardo medeiros"
<eduardo.medeiros@marinha.mil.br>

Enviadas: Quarta-feira, 18 de junho de 2025 13:36:14

Assunto: Re: Batteries aquisition (Brazil)

Prezado CC Leonardo Caixeta, boa tarde.



Face ao histérico e visando ATD ao Esqd o mais répido possivel, minha intengdo é encaminhar uma %/

mensagem pedindo para ratificar a cota¢do recebida e os termos/condicdes da empresa e, caso RAT,
IND recursos e indicar os recursos. ‘

Respeitosamente / Atenciosamente,

CF (IM) Victor

Encarregado da Divisdo de Procura e Aquisicdo
Encarregado da Divisdo de Trafego de Cargas
CNBW

RETELMA: 8151-1310

- leonardo.victor@marinha.mil.br

De: "Leonardo Caixeta" <leonardo.caixeta@marinha.mil.br>

Para: "Michael Izzo" <Michael.lzzo@insitu.com>

Cc: "james morgan" <James.Morgan@insitu.com>, "estrella" <estrella@marinha.mil.br>, "daniel
chaves" <daniel.chaves@marinha.mil.br>, "Cardinot" <cardinot@marinha.mil.br>, "Kenna Welsch"
<Kenna.Welsch@insitu.com>, "Millor" <09005005@marinha.mil.br>, "Michael P. Edwards"
<Michael Edwards@insitu.com>, "Victor" <leonardo.victor@marinha.mil.br>, "eduardo medeiros"
<eduardo.medeiros@marinha.mil.br>

Enviadas: Quarta-feira, 18 de junho de 2025 13:27:00

Assunto: Re: Batteries aquisition (Brazil)

Dear Mr. Izzo,

Thanks for the quotation. We are going to start the process here and have news soon. LCDR Millor (in
copy) will be making the necessaries arrengments.

Best Regards,

L.CDR Leonardo Caixeta

LEONARDO de Souza CAIXETA
Capitdo de Corveta(EN)/LCDR
Enc da Divisdo de Material/CQ
Tel. +55(22)2621-4243

Sistelma 8117-4243
leonardo.caixeta@marinha.mil.br



%

- LEONARDO de Souza CAIXETA
“Capitdo de Corveta(EN)/LCDR
Enc da Divisdo de Material/CQ
Tel. +55(22)2621-4243
Sistelma 8117-4243
leonardo.caixeta@marinha.mil.br



Cnbw-313

Legenda
Manual SiGDEM

Mensagem Recebida

¥ 1 k)
PRINCIFAL ACQ&F&&H:&&%E&TQ} ARQUIVOS COMENTARIOS i
wail canal Precedéncia Data-Hora
Sigilo ana Agdo Info
Ostensivo oo ROTINA ROTINA R0620342/SET/2024

De: FORAER
Para: COMESQ
Info: ABASTC, AENAUT, CITSPA, COPEAB, ESQARP, NAVUSA
Assunto: SE-PE 91100-2024-00282 & SE-PE 91100-2024-00288 (ALT para prioridade 4).
Texto: SE-PE 91100-2024-00282 a SE-PE 91100-2024-00288 (ALT para prioridade 4).

CFM previsto no inciso "d” do item 1.3 do Anexo B da ABASTCMARINST 20-02B, CNS

PSB AUT elevar o grau de prioridade das SE-PE91100-2024-00282 &

SE-PE91100-2024-00288 para prioridade 4 (Especial).

PTC que a AQS dos itens SOL nas respectivas SE-PE faz-se NEC devido & validade

de itens do sistema que irdo expirar no primeiro semestre de 2025, além da

inexisténcia de sobressalentes em estoque que apresentaram alta taxa de AVR.

Caso as respectivas SE-PE néo sejam atendidas em tempo habil, todo o Sistema

SARP-E ScanEagle pode ser indisponibilizando para operacdo BT
Observagoes:
-Tramite: MSG; 31; ARQ

Data de Entrada Exige Providéncia? Agdo

09/09/2024 N&o 31
NC° Controle
Situagdo Atual Préximo NAVUSA-
Em Tradmite 31 ARQ MR-2024/09-00474

w4






Cnbw-313

Legenda R
Manual SiGDEM Mensagem Recebida

{ PRINCIPAL } ACOMPANHAMENTO ARQUIVOS COMENTARIOS !

N Precedéncia Data-Hora
Sigilo Canal Acdo Info
Ostensivo DD ROTINA ROTINA R0919042/SET/2024
De: COMESQ

Para: FORAER
Info: ABASTC AENAUT CITSPA COPEAB ESQARP NAVUSA
Assunto: SE-PE 91100-2024-00282 & SE-PE 91100-2024-00288 (ALT para prioridade 4).

Texto: SE-PE 91100-2024-00282 & SE-PE 91100-2024-00288 (ALT para prioridade 4).

R0620347Z, RAT grau de prioridade "4" (ESPECIAL) para a SE citada na MSG em REF
BT

R-062034Z/SET/2024 DE FORAER PARA COMESQ INFO ABASTC AENAUT CITSPA
COPEAB ESQARP NAVUSA//fiHTTITHTIT

SE-PE 91100-2024-00282 a SE-PE 91100-2024-00288 (ALT para prioridade 4).

CFM previsto no inciso "d" do item 1.3 do Anexo B da ABASTCMARINST 20-02B, CNS
PSB AUT elevar o grau de prioridade das SE-PE91100-2024-00282 &
SE-PE91100-2024-00288 para prioridade 4 (Especial).

PTC que a AQS dos itens SOL nas respectivas SE-PE faz-se NEC devido & validade
de itens do sistema que irdo expirar no primeiro semestre de 2025, além da
inexisténcia de sobressalentes em estoque que apresentaram alta taxa de AVR.
Caso as respectivas SE-PE néo sejam atendidas em tempo hébil, todo o Sistema
SARP-E ScanFEagle pode ser indisponibilizando para operac¢do BT

Observagbes:
* Respondido pela mensagem R2717312/SET/2024.

Referéncia(s):
RO62034Z/SET/ 2024 (NAVUSA-MR-2024/09-00474)
R271731Z/SET/ 2024 (NAVUSA-MT-2024/09~00290)

Tramite: MSG; 31; ARQ

Data de Entrada Exige Providéncia? Acdo
10/09/2024 Nédo 31

NO Controle
Situagdo Atual Préximo NAVUSA-

Em Tramite 31 ARQ MR-2024/09-00499




7 N



Cnbw-313

Legenda N
Manual SIGDEM Mensagem Recebida

PRINCIFAL ACOMPANHAMENTO T ARGUIVOS COMENTARIOS %
siail c I Precedéncia Data-Hora
o igilo ana Agdo Info
stensivo b ROTINA ROTINA R2420342/0UT/2024
De: FORAER

Para: ABASTC, NAVUSA
Info:  AENAUT, CITSPA, COMESQ, COPEAB, ESQARP, GANMNT
Assunto: SSEE PE91100-2024-00282 a 00288 (Sobressalentes para 0 SARP-E ScanEagle)

Texto: SSEE PE91100-2024-00282 a 00288 (Sobressalentes para o SARP-E ScanEagle)
R-271731Z/SET de NAVUSA XMT GANMNT, CNS PSB:
ALFA - CNBW: CAN SE PE91100-2024-00282 do processo de obtengdo Q2024-0083;

BRAVO - DABM: VTD valor total das SSEE do processo de obtencdo Q2024-0083
tornar-se inferior a US$50.000,00 apés CPR o item ALFA, CNS PSB analisar os
Documentos Circunstanciados ENC por intermédio do e-maii n¢ 1403/2024 deste
Comando de Forga, ACD inciso Il do art. 27 da Portaria GM-MD n? 5.175/2021, e
item B-1 do BONO Especial n® 836/2022 da SGM; e

CHARLIE - RTR R-271731Z/SET/2024 DE NAVUSA PARA FORAER INFO ABASTC AENAUT
CITSPA COMESQ COPEAB ESQARP:

"SSEE PE91100-2024-00282 a 00288 (Sobressalentes para o SARP-E ScanEagle)

R-091904Z de COMESQ, pracesso de abtencao Q2024-0083 (prioridade "4"), atinente
as SSEE PE91100-2024-00282 a 60288, PTC:

ALFA - A pesquisa de mercado foi concluida com a participacio de 64 empresas,
sendo a INSITU, INC. (CODEMP 02FP7) a Gnica a cotar, CFM abaixo:

-SE ...QONT.. Valor (USD)
- PE91100-2024-0028 73.009,44
- PE91100-2024-0028

USD 92.114,32
USD 3.936,70

BRAVO - atribuido status CRI, substatus TJ, as SSEE.

Face ao exposto, caso haja interesse em prosseguir com a AQS, CNS PSB:
UNO - ALT tipo da SE de "L" para "F";

DOIS - Providenciar documentacdo, CFM item B-2 do BONO Especial n? 836/2022 e
Portaria GM-MD n® 5.175/2021, e encaminhar para andlise da CJACM; e

TRES - Anexar no SOMAR o Processo de Justificativa de Inexigibilidade de
Licitagdo, apds saneamento de eventuais discrepancias apontadas pela CJACM e
publica¢do em DOU BT" BT

Observagdes:

Referéncia(s):
63089.002917/2024-11 (NAVUSA-ER-2024/10-00412)
R271731Z/SET/2024 (NAVUSA-MT-2024/09-00290)

Tramite: MSG; 31; ARQ

Data de Entrada Exige Providéncia? Agdo
25/10/2024 N&o 31

N° Controle
Situagio Atual Préoximo NAVUSA-
Em Trémite 31 ARQ MR-2024/10-01053

D






Cnbw-313

Legenda
Manual SiGDEM

Mensagem a Transmitir

PRINCIPAL ACOMPANHAMENTC ARQUIVOS COMENTARIOS

Precedéncia
Sigilo Canal =z Data-Hora
Acdo Info
Ostensivo DD s R271731Z/SET/2024
ROTINA ROTINA
De: NAVUSA

Para: FORAER
Info: ABASTC, AENAUT, CITSPA, COMESQ, COPEAB, ESQARP
Assunto: SSEE PE91100-2024-00282 & 00288 (Sobressalentes para o SARP-E ScanEagle)

Texto: SSEE PE91100-2024-00282 & 00288 (Sobressalentes para o SARP-E ScanEagle)

R-091904Z de COMESQ, processo de obtencdo Q2024-0083 (prioridade "4"), atinente
as SSEE PES1100-2024-00282 & 00288, PTC:

ALFA - A pesquisa de mercado foi concluida com a participaco de 64 empresas,
sendo a INSITU, INC. (CODEMP 02FP7) a Unica a cotar, CFM abaixo:

“SE.iind QNT.......Valor (USD)
-PES1100-2024-00282.....1.......... 73
-PE91100-2024-00283.....2...

- PE91100-2024-00284.
- PE91100-2024-00285.
- PE91100-2024-00286.
- PE91100-2024-00287.
- PES1100-2024-00288.

- Subtotal ...
- Custos indiretos de obtengdo.. USD 3.936,70
~Total.....cccoeere i, USD 96.051,02; €

BRAVO - atribuido status CRI, substatus T], as SSEE.
Face ao exposto, caso haja interesse em prosseguir com a AQS, CNS PSB:
UNO - ALT tipo da SE de "L" para "F";

DOIS - Providenciar documentacdo, CFM item B-2 do BONO Especial n? 836/2022 ¢
Portaria GM-MD n? 5.175/2021, e encaminhar para andlise da CJACM; e

TRES - Anexar no SOMAR o Processo de Justificativa de Inexigibilidade de
Licitacao, apés saneamento de eventuais discrepancias apontadas pela CJACM e
publicagdo em DOU BT

R-091904Z/SET/2024 DE COMESQ PARA FORAER INFO ABASTC AENAUT CITSPA COPEAB
ESQARP NAVUSA//IIT

SE-PE 91100-2024-00282 a SE-PE 91100-2024-00288 (ALT para prioridade 4).

R062034Z, RAT grau de prioridade “4* (ESPECIAL) para a SE citada na MSG em REF
BT

R-062034Z/SET/2024 DE FORAER PARA COMESQ INFO ABASTC AENAUT CITSPA COPEAB
ESQARP NAVUSA//IHTIIITIIIIIT

SE-PE 91100-2024-00282 & SE-PE 91100-2024-00288 (ALT para prioridade 4).

CFM previsto no inciso "d" do item 1.3 do Anexo B da ABASTCMARINST 20-02B, CNS
PSB AUT elevar o grau de prioridade das SE-PE91100-2024-00282 &
SE-PE91100-2024-00288 para prioridade 4 {Especial).

PTC que a AQS dos itens SOL nas respectivas SE-PE faz-se NEC devido a validade
de itens do sistema que ir&o expirar no primeiro semestre de 2025, além da
inexisténcia de sobressalentes em estoque que apresentaram aita taxa de AVR.
Caso as respectivas SE-PE nédo sejam atendidas em tempo habil, todo o Sistema
SARP-E ScanFagle pode ser indisponibilizando para operacdo BT

Observagdes: Em resposta 8 mensagem R091904Z/SET/2024

Referéncia(s): {Excluir Todas]
[Excluir] RO91S04Z/SET/2024 (NAVUSA-MR-2024/09-00499)

Tramite: 31; 30, MSG; 31; ARQ

Autorizado? Data da Autorizagdo Prazo Transmisséo Situagdo da Emissdo
Sim 27/09/2024 Transmitida
Situagéo Atual Préoximo N° Controle

Em Tramite 31 ARQ NAVUSA-MT-2024/09-00290

i)







Precedéncia

Sigilo Canal Agao Info Data-Hora
Ostensivo DD ROTINA  ROTINA R2319187/1UL/2025
De: NAVUSA
Para: COMTIM

Info:

Assunto: AQS de modulos de interface Digirig Mobile (SE DV49000-2025-00001 /
Q2025-0040)

Texto: AQS de médulos de interface Digirig Mobile (SE DV49000-2025-00001 / Q2025-0040)
REF SE DV-49000-2025-00001 para AQS de mddulos de interface Digirig Mobile, PTC:

ALFA - Solicitagao de aquisigao, classificada como “obtengao exclusiva” (tipo
“F”), CFM caracterizacao constante no Documento Circunstanciado n? 01/2025,
desta DE;

BRAVO - RCB cotagédo vélida por 45 dias, emitida pela empresa #AXZS SOFTCOMPLEX,
INC (RFQ Q2025-0040), contemplando:

- 10 unidades no valor unitério de USD 49,97

- Custo de trafego de carga no exterior: USD 100,00

- Total: USD 597,97; e

CHARLIE - Gerada a Ordem de Compra P2025-0007/0, a qual serd ENC a empresa,
apo6s o RCB dos créditos orgamentérios.

Face ao exposto, a fim de prosseguir com as etapas da obtengéo, CNS PSB IND
crédito no valor de USD 597,97, langando no campo “Observacgao do Solicitante” a
destinacéo do recurso e o nimero da OC P2025-0007, a fim de permitir a
rastreabilidade do crédito indicado, CFM orientacées previstas no Anexo D, da
ABASTCMARINST n? 20-02B.

Observacoes:

Tramite: 31; 30; MSG; 31; ARQ

Para 311; 312; 313; 314; 01; 30
Conhecimento:
Ciente: 01; 30

Data da Autorizagao Situacdo da Emissdo

i ?
Autorizado? 23/07/2025 Transmitida

Sim

N©° Controle
Situacdo Atual Préoximo NAVUSA-
Em Tramite 31 ARQ MT-2025/07-01102






A

Part | - Supplier Cértific}ate of Conformity

1. Supplier COC Serial Number:

PID20250818141339599-001

2. Supplier (include Name, Address, E-mail etc.}):
insitu, Incorporated

118 E. Columbia River Way

Bingen, WA 98605

USA

3. Contract Number:
0
P2025-0006/2

s

4, Contract Modification Number:
NA

5. Approved Deviations and/or Concessions:
NA

7. Delivery Address:
Brazilian Naval Commission
KFS/SCHENKER 1AD

113 EXECUTIVE DR

6. Acquirer (include Name, Address, email etc.)
Brazilian Naval Commission

Brazilian Naval Commission

5130 MacArthur Blvd

Washington DC DC
USA 20016

8. Applicable to:

SUITE 114

STERLING VA Partial Delivery Number: NA

USA 20166 Final Deiivery Number: NA

9, Contract SQ $0-020497 11. Quantity 13, Undelivered
Line 0 NSN 1680-01-661-6454 CLIN 2 1.0000 Qty NA
Item NA PN 002-000906-000 REV 01

SN/LOT €-600-250113-03

NOMEN BUNGEE, CAPTURE, 16.5 - 17.0 FT

12, Shipment NA
Document

14. Supplier Remarks or Comments

15. Supplier Statement of Conformity

NA it is certified that apart from the approved deviation
permits/concessions noted in block #5 above, the products listed
above conform in all respects to the contract requirements and the
products are considered ready for release to service.

Date: 8/27/2025 Supplier Name and Title Supplier Signature

Name: Insitu Inc.
Phone: 509-493-8600

Email: QualityManagement@insitu.com

Pounl Gowrley
08-27-2025 08:02.15
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Asmngr

Part | - Supplier Certificate of Conformity

L. Supplier COC Serial Number:

PID20250818141339599-002

1. Supplier {include Nage Address;

nsitu, Incorporate q
118 E. Columbia River Wa
Jingen, WA 98605

JSA ‘

E-mail etc.):

3. Contract Number:
0
P2025-0006/2

4, Contract Modification Number:
NA

5, Approved Deviations and/or Con
NA

cessions:

1\ belivery Address:
Braziflan Ngval Commission
KES/SCHENKER IAD

113 EXECUTIVE DR

6. Acquirer {include Name, Address, email etc.)
Brazilian Naval Commission

Brazilian Naval Commission

5130 MacArthur Bivd

Washington DC DC
USA 20016

SUITE 114 8. Applicable to:
STERLING VA Partial Delivery Number: NA
USA 20166 Final Delivery Number: NA
9, Contract 50 $0-020497 11, Quantity 13. Undelivered
Line 0 NSN  1680-01-661-6454 CUN 2 1.0000 Qty NA
ltem NA PN 002-000906-000 REV 01
NOMEN BUNGEE, CAPTURE, 16.5- 17.0 FT 12. Shipment NA
SN/LOT C-600-250113-04 Document

14, Supplier Remarks or Comments
NA

15, Supplier Statement of Conformity

It is certified that apart from the approved deviation
permits/concessions noted in block #5 above, the products listed
above conform in all respects to the contract requirements and the
products are considered ready for release to service.

Date: 8/27/2025

Supplier Name and Title
Name: Insitu Inc.
Phone: 509-493-8600

Email: QualityManagement@insitu.com

Supplier Signature

Paul Gourley
08-27-2025 08:02.15




Pl Part | - Supplier Certificate of Conformity

1. Supplier COC Serial Number: PID20250818141339599-003

2. Supplier {(include Name, Address, E-mail etc.):
Insitu, Incorporated

118 E. Columbia River Way

Bingen, WA 98605

USA

3. Contract Number:

0 ( :
P2025-0006/2 S %ﬂ o

4, Contract Modification Number:
NA

5. Approved Deviations and/or Concessions:
NA

7. Delivery Address:
Brazilian Naval Commission
KFS/SCHENKER IAD

113 EXECUTIVE DR

6. Acquirer (include Name, Address, email etc.)
Brazilian Naval Commission

Brazilian Naval Commission

5130 MacArthur Bivd

Washington DC DC
USA 20016

SUITE 114 8. Applicable to:
STERLING VA Partial Delivery Number: NA
USA 20166 Final DeHVery Number: NA
9. Contract SO 50-020497 11. Quantity 13. Undelivered
line0 NSN 1680-01-661-6454 CLIN 2 1.0000 Qty NA
Iitem NA PN 002-000906-000 REV 01
NOMEN BUNGEE, CAPTURE, 16.5- 17.0FT 12. Shipment NA
SN/LOT €-600-250113-05 Document

14. Supplier Remarks or Comments

15. Supplier Statement of Conformity

NA It is certified that apart from the approved deviation
permits/concessions noted in block #5 above, the products listed
above conform in all respects to the contract requirements and the
products are considered ready for release to service.

Date: 8/27/2025 Supplier Name and Title Supplier Signature

Name: Insitu Inc.
Phone: 509-493-8600

Email: QualityManagement@insitu.com

Pouwl Gowrley
08-27-2025 08:02.15
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A Binesing Comgisy

Part | - Supplier Certificate of Conformity

« Supplier COC Serial Number:

PiD20250818141339599-004

. Supplier {include Name, Address, E-mail etc.):
1sity, Incorporated
18 E. Columbia River Way

3. Contract Number:
0
P2025-0006/2

ingen, WA 98605 |
ISA ' %‘ 4. Contract Modification Number:
l”T NA
Ln
. Approved Deviations and/or Concegsions: 6. Acquirer (include Name, Address, email ete.)
NA ' Brazilian Naval Commission
Brazilian Naval Commission
5130 MacArthur Blvd
7. Delivery Addrass: Washington DC DC
Brazilian Naval Commission USA 20016
KFS/SCHENKER I1AD
113 EXECUTIVE DR
SUITE 114 8. Applicable to:
STERLING VA Partial Delivery Number: NA
USA 20166 Final Delivery Number: NA
9, Contract 50 S0-020497 11. Quantity 13. Undelivered
Line 0 NSN  1680-01-661-6454 CUN 2 1.0000 Qty NA
ltem NA PN 002-000906-000 REV 01

SN/LOT C-600-250113-06

NOMEN BUNGEE, CAPTURE, 16.5 - 17.0 FT

12. Shipment NA
Document

14. Supplier Remarks or Comments
NA

15. Supplier Statement of Conformity

It is certified that apart from the approved deviation
permits/concessions noted in block #5 above, the products listed
above conform in all respects to the contract requirements and the
products are considered ready for release to service.

Date: 8/27/2025 Supplier Name and Title
Name: Insitu Inc.

Phone: 509-493-8600

Email: QualityManagement@insitu.com

Supplier Signature

Paul Gowrley
08-27-2025 08:02.15
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# Boaing Gaopery

Part | - Supplier Cértific'ate of Conformity

1. Supplier COC Serial Number: PID20250818141339599-005 % 6=—
2. Supplier (include Name, Address, E-mail etc.): 3. Contract Number: f
Insitu, Incorporated 0 - vﬁ
118 E. Columbia River Way P2025-0006/2
Bingen, WA 98605
USA 4, Contract Modification Number:
NA

5. Approved Deviations and/or Concessions:
NA

7. Delivery Address:
Brazilian Naval Commission
KFS/SCHENKER IAD

113 EXECUTIVE DR

6. Acquirer (include Name, Address, email etc.)
Brazilian Naval Commission

Brazilian Naval Commission

5130 MacArthur Blvd

Washington DC DC
USA 20016

SUITE 114 8, App“cablﬂ to:
STERLING VA Partial Delivery Number: NA
USA 20166 Final Delivery Number: NA
9. Contract SO 50-020497 11. Quantity 13. Undelivered
Line 0 NSN 2945-01-593~1716 CLIN 3 2.0000 Qty NA
lterm NA PN 007-060025R00 REV
NOMEN Filter, Oil, Hydraulic 12, Shipment NA
SN/LOT Document

14. Supplier Remarks or Comments
NA

15, Supplier Statement of Conformity

It is certified that apart from the approved deviation
permits/concessions noted in block #5 above, the products listed
ahove conform in all respects to the contract requirements and the
products are considered ready for release to service.

Date: 8/27/2025 Supplier Name and Title
Name: Insitu Inc.

Phone: 509-493-8600

Email: QualityManagement@insitu.com

Supplier Signature

Paul Gouwrley
08-27-2025 08:02.15




£ Biosing Larrgaamy

Part 1 - Supplier Certificate of Conformity

L. Supplier Cﬂ% i\lurnber:

PID20250818141339599-006

. Supplier (i Ty Name, Addré;s, E-mail etc.):

nsitu, Incorporate '
.18 E. Columbia Rifigr Way-

lingen, WA 98605
JSA T,

3. Contract Number:
0
P2025-0006/2

4, Contract Modification Number:
NA

5. Approved Deviations and/or Concessions:
NA

7. Delivery Address:
Brazilian Naval Commission
KFS/SCHENKER IAD

113 EXECUTIVE DR

6. Acquirer (include Name, Address, email etc.)
Brazilian Naval Commission

Brazilian Naval Commission

5130 MacArthur Blvd

Washington DC DC
USA 20016

8. Applicable to:

SUITE 114

STERLING VA Partial Delivery Number: NA

USA 20166 Final Delivery Number: NA

9. Contract SO $0-020487 11. Quantity 13. Undelivered
Line 0 NSN  2945-01-593-1701 CLN 5 2.0000 Gty NA
ftem NA PN 021-100011R00 REV 00

SN/LOT

NOMEN FILTER-SEPARATOR, LIQUID FUEL - 15 GPH,

12. Shipment NA
Document

14. Supplier Remarks or Comments
NA

15, Supplier Statement of Conformity

It is certified that apart from the approved deviation
permits/concessions noted in block #5 above, the products listed
above conform in all respects to the contract requirements and the
products are considered ready for release to service.

Date: 8/27/2025 Supplier Name and Title
Name: Insitu Inc.

Phone: 509-483-8600

Email: QualityManagement@insitu.com

Supplier Signature

Paul Gourley
08-27-2025 08:02.15




A sy Coooarny

Part 1 -~ Supplier Cértifricpate of Conformity

1. Supplier COC Serial Number:

PID20250818141339599-007 L 75

2. Supplier (include Name, Address, E-mail etc.):
Insitu, Incorporated

118 E. Columbia River Way

Bingen, WA 98605

USA

3. Contract Number: e (g{ ,

P2025-0006/2

4. Contract Modification Number:
NA

5. Approved Deviations and/or Concessions:
NA

7. Delivery Address:
Brazilian Naval Commission
KFS/SCHENKER JAD

113 EXECUTIVE DR

6. Acquirer (include Name, Address, email etc.)
Brazilian Naval Commission

Brazilian Naval Commission

5130 MacArthur Blvd

Washington DC DC
USA 20016

SUITE 114 8. Applicable to:

STERLING VA Partial Delivery Number: NA

USA 20166 Final Delivery Number: NA

9. Contract SO $0-020497 11. Quantity 13, Undelivered
Line 0 NSN  6140-01-595-2498 CUN 4 12.0000 Qty NA
Item NA PN 300-204300R00 REV 02

SN/LOT 8/13/2025

NOMEN BATTERY ASSEMBLY - AIRCRAFT, 19.2V, 1500

12, Shipment NA
Document

14. Supplier Remarks or Comments

15. Supplier Statement of Conformity

NA It is certified that apart from the approved deviation
permits/concessions noted in block #5 above, the products listed
above conform in all respects to the contract requirements and the
products are considered ready for release to service.

Date: 8/27/2025 Supplier Name and Title Supplier Signature

Name: Insitu Inc.
Phone: 509-493-8600

Email: QualityManagement@insitu.com

Poaud Gouwrley
08-27-2025 08:02.15




Amm

Part | - Supplier Certificate of Conformity

L. Supplier COC Serial Number:

PID20250818141339599-008

2. Supplier (include Nam~ “ddress, E-mail etc.):
nsitu, Incorporatec :

118 E. Columbia River Way
3ingen, WA 98605 *Q

JSA

3. Contract Number:
0
P2025-0006/2

4. Contract Modification Number:
NA

5. Approved Deviations an,d/cr/(:oncessions:
NA

7. Delivery Address:
Brazilian Naval Commission
KFS/SCHENKER IAD

113 EXECUTIVE DR

6. Acquirer (include Name, Address, email etc.)
Brazilian Naval Commission

Brazilian Naval Commission

5130 MacArthur Blvd

Washington DC DC
USA 20016

SUITE 114 8. Applicable to:

STERLING VA Pfartial Delivery Number: NA

USA 20166 Final Delivery Number: NA

9. Contract S0 50-020497 11. Quantity 13. Undelivered
Line 0 NSN  5841-01-586-9034 CUN 1 6.0000 Qty NA
Item NA PN 400-819510R00 REV 00

SN/LOT

NOMEN ANTENNA TRANSPONDER, MODE C

12. Shipment NA
Document

14. Supplier Remarks or Comments
NA

15. Supplier Statement of Conformity

Itis certified that apart from the approved deviation
permits/concessions noted in block #5 above, the products listed
above conform in all respects to the contract requirements and the
products are considered ready for release to service.

Date: 8/27/2025 Supplier Name and Title
Name: Insitu Inc.

Phone: 509-493-8600

Email: QualityManagement@insitu.com

Supplier Signature

Paul Gowrley
08-27-2025 08:02.15




